AMENDMENT NO. TWO TO CONTRACT NO. 33300 3323 ()

Wb e

RE: Renewal No. Two of Contract No. 33300 (PA-05713) for furnishing and delivering general
automotive parts to the City of Long Beach (BPFM14000012)

This Amendment to Contract No. 33300 is made and entered as of November 28, 2016, by and between the
CITY OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and H & H Auto Parts Wholesale.

Contract No. 33300 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as indicated below by a check or
other mark preceding the appropriate amendment:

X 1. The term is extended to November 28, 2017,
X 2. $40,000 has been added for a total (“not to exceed”) amount of $135,000.
3. Prices during this period shall remain firm.

}{ 4. The price for certain items shall be increased as shown on Exhibit “B”, which is attached hereto and
incorporated herein by this reference.

5. The price for certain items shall be decreased as shown on Exhibit “B”, which is attached hereto and
incorporated herein by this reference.

6. The discount offered to the City is increased by Ya

7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit “B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract.

8. The items or locations identified on Exhibit “B”, which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby added to the Contract,

9. Current permits, licenses, insurance and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1.

Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions in this Contract are ratified and confirmed and
remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated above.

Attach Notary if Out-of-State Contractor

CONTRACTOR: - CONTRACTOR: )
\\
?‘%% el W“Z ‘”"“m.\\\ w«w».w.i .
[ASighature) (Signature) ™
YU L P ey B NUTEIRALT L Rara
(Print / Type Rame) = 1_ -~ (Prlnt / Type Name)
President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer Presrgwt; Gl(::;a;é5|dent/ Secretary / Treasurer
{circle one) (circle one)

THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

By: W Approved as to form:
' City Manager CHARL PARKIW
Assistant City Manager

Deputy

EXECUTED PURSUANT W
TO SECTION 301 OF
THE CITY CHARTER.
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Heavy Duty Brake
H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
item Part Number Description Manufacturer Cost to City Discount Percentage 2016-2017 Piicing
S2R7017173 Brake Pads Rockwallf!\-;lerltor 5 251.74 PLUS11%| $ 259,28
3218J1076 Brake Rotor RockwoellMerttor | § 497.44 PLUS 15%} $ 512.36
R230104 Tie Rod End Rockwel/Meritor | § 159.31 PLUS 11%| § 164.0%
310-305/Dayion
ABS Quick
R950059 Release Valve RockweallVieritor | $ 53.88 PLUS 11%[ § 55.60
RB02488 Slack Adjuster Rockwell/Meritor 1§ b5.67 PLUS 15%1 $ 57.24
05-362/Dayton
RB02487 Stack Adjuster RocleliMerlior 1§ 55.57 PLUS 15%| § 57.24
05-362{Dayion
15018 Brake Kit Rockwe)?ll\derj;_or 3 12.80 PLUS 11%| $ 14.01
RE07064 Brake Kit Rockweall/Meritor 3 13.37 PiLUS 15%| § 13.77
08-114800/Dayicn
4514TQ Brake Shoe ReckwelMeritor | $ 54.11 PLUS 15%| § 55.73
. SB23F4515Q/DAYTON
4726 Brake Shoe RockwaliMeritor [ § 112.03 PLUS 15%] § 115.39
SB21P4726E2/Daylon
RE01711 {Havis Yoke RockweliMeritor 1§ 3.62 [LESS 45% 3 .73
19040VELVAG
871018 Brake Drum Gentrifuse $ 150,76 [PLUS 4% $ 155.28
B6093 Brake Drum Webb § 144.58 (PLUS 4% 3 145,92
36004 Brake Drum Gunite % 968.51 |PLUS 4% $ £9.41
M2508L Cam Shaft BWP $ 31.18 PLUS 15% § 32,12
: 04-481362/0ayton
M3216 Wheel Stud BWP 3 3.76 PLUS 18%] § 3.86
MO303 Connector BWP NB NB NB
MK81 Cam Shaft Kit BWP $ 10.08 PLUS 15%] $ 10.35
D8-131800/Dayton
Mic17 Spring Kit BWE $ 8.11 PLUS 15%) § 8.35
08-130200/Dayton 1
33941 Outer Wheel Nut_{BWP 3 0.63 PLUS 15%| $ 0.85
43-3012R/Dayicn
107796(New) ADB Cart Kit Bendix $ 36.20 [LESS 45% 3 37.38
34048/veivac
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Contract #33300; Renewal No, 2
(11/28/20186 to 11/28/2017)

103009{New) R12 Valve Bendix 20.35 |LESS 45% $ 30,23
34026/ Velvac
23443 T9 Diaphram Bendix 3.62 PLUS 15%] $ 3.73
12-40009/Dayton |
234100 T24 Diaphram Bendix 3.97 PLUS 15%)| $ 4.09
12-40024/Dayton |
281126(New) PP1 Valve Kit Bendix 12.54 |LESS 45% $ 12.92
34013/Velvac |
450877 Axle Gasket Chicago Rawhide 0.90 |Less 25% $ 0.93
733107/National |
343-4009 Huh Cap Kit Sianco 14.06 {Less 25% 3 14.48
343-008/National |
359-5990 Cap Plug Stanco 242 [Less 25% $ 2.49
B5289/National |
30/30 Complete
3430051 Brake Can MGM 44.85 PLUS 15%| § 46.20
3030C/Dayton |
3232008 Piggyback Plus _ |MGM 109.78 PLUS 11%| $ 113.07
|
3233051 Spring Brake MGM 47.31 PLUS 15%| $ 48.73
3030CL/dayton |
'T24 Brake
MA36240 Chamber Midtand 22,86 |LESS 45% 3 23.55
30019/Velvac |
T16 Brake
MA36160 Chamber Midland 22.50 |LESS 45% 3 23.18
30016/Velvac |
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Coniract #33300; Renewal No. 2
(11/29/2016 to 14/28/2017)

Light Duty Brake
H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
Costto City Discount Percentage 2016-2017 Pricing
Part # Description  {Manufacturer
BD125008 [Brake Rotor  {\Wagner $ 12.80 21% $13.18
[ |
BD125082 |[Braks Rotor  |Wagner $ 42,17 ~21% $43.44
[ |
BD125209 |Brake Drum  [Wagner $ 40.56 ~21% $41.78
I |
Master
MC131285 {Cylinder Wagner $ 55.51 -10% $57.18
[ I
MX154 Brake Pads Wagner $ 20,45 ~-34% $21.06
I |
MX249 Brake Pads  |Wagner $ 28.59 -34% $30.58
[ |
MX389 Brake Pads Wagner $ 28.69 -34% $30.58
| |
MX601 Brake Pads Wagner $ 29.83 -34% $30.72
[
MXE79 Brake Pads Wagner $ 33.59 ~34% $34.60
[ ]
FAB357AR |Brake Shoes {Wagner 3 43,69 -34% $45.00
[ |
PAB461R  |Brake Shoes |Wagner $ 41.34 -34% $42.68
i
PAB452R  |Brake Shoes [|Wagner $ 77.87 -34% $80.21
I |
PAB704R  |Brake Shoes [Wagner [ 24.88 -34% $25,63
[ t
Seveve Duty
SX777 Pads Wagner $ 40.32 -34% $41.53
[ |
Seveve Duty
SX702 Pads Wagner 5 38.60 -34% $39.75
I |
H5554 Brake Kit Carlson $ 515 -2% $5.30
18K2500/AC Delco | |
H5588 Brake Kit Carlson $ 4.74 | -2% $4,88
18K274X/AC Delco | |
H5584 Brake Kit Carlson $ 7.90 | -2% $8.14
18K247X/AC Delco | |
H7181 Brake Kit Carlson 3 6.55 | -2% $6.75
18K540/AC Delco i |
H7225 Brake Kit Carlson $ 4.59 | 2% $4.73
18K565/AC Delco f ]
H7284 Brake Kit Carlscn $ 3,687 2% $3.78
18KB39/AC Delco |
370003A  [Seal Naticnal 3 27,68 -25% $28.41
I |
2081 Seal National $ 6.68 -25% §6.88
I |
4148 Seal National 3 5.14 -25% $5,29
[ |
25880 Bearing National $ 17.38 -25% $17.91
[ |
Al2 Bearing National 3 5.29 -25% 3$6.48
I
203FF Bearing National 3 7.28 -25% $7.50
] |
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Contract #33300; Renewal No, 2
(11/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

Belt
H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
Cost to City Discount Percentage 2016-2017 Pricing

7312 Belt Gates § 6,01 -5% $6.19
15312/AC Delco

7480 Belt Gates $ 7.79 | -5% $8.02
15480/AC Delco

17485 Belt Goodyear | § 9.80 | -5% $10.09
17485/AC Delco

40276 Timing Belt Goodyear | § 13.34 | -5% $13.74
TB276/AC Delco

4050420  [Belt Goodyear [ $ 10.62 | -5% $10.94
EK420/AC Delco

KO60685H0 [Belt Gates $ 19.36 | -5% $19.94]

K060685HD/AC Delco

Kos0685  [Belt Gates 5 16.70 | 5% $17.20
BK685/AC Delco

K081196  |Belt Gales $ 26.19 | 5% $26,98
8K1196/AC Delco

38005 Idier Pulley Gates $ 14.20 | -5% $14.83
38005/AC Delco

49012 Beit Tensicner |Goodyear | § 12.63 | ~5% $13.01
38003/AC Delco

38123 RBelt Tensioner [Gates 3 32.46 | -5% $33.43
38123/AC Delco
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Contract #33300; Renewal No, 2
{11/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

Filtration1 H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Atleta

Costto City Discount Percentage 2016-2017 Pricing

46134 [Fitter  Iwix $ 293 -5%| § 3.02
A1115CF/AC Delco

51372 |Filter  [wix $ 2.34 | -5%| & 241
PF1250F/AC Delco

45770 [Filter  fwix $ 55.10 | -48%]| § 56.75
RS3870/Baldwin

46771 Filter  |Wix [ 30.35 | -48%] § 31.26
RS3871/Baldwin

46922 Filter Wix 3 28.69 | -48%| § 28,55
R34992/Baldwin

46923 [Filier  [Wix § 15.85 | -48%| § 16.43
R55328/Baldwin

33087 [Fiter  [Wix $ 4.66 | -5%| § 4.80
GF510F/AC Delco

58955  |Filter  |Wix 3 12,64 | -5%| § 13.02
TF302/AC Delco

46139 [Filter  [Wix $ 5,51 | -48%| 5.68
PAZ160/Baidwin

33097 Filter Wix $ 4.66 | -5%| § 4,80
GF510F/AC Delco

33118 Filter Wix $ 4.03 | -5%| $ 4.15
TPY15DF/AC Delce

33122 Filter Wix [ 3.80 | -5%| $ 3.71
TPo28F/AC Delco

57060 [Filter  |Wix § 2.54 | -5%]| 8 2.52
PF4BE/AC Dslco

57133 |Filter  |Wix 5 13,39 | -48%)| § 13.79
PT8407/Baldwin
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Contract #33300; Renewal No. 2

(11/29/201

§to 11/28/2017)

Lighting H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
Cost to City Discount Percentage 2016-2017 Pricing
12182 Mirror Grote 8.26 -33% $8.51
|
12173 Miror Grote 7.09 -33% $7.30
12272-5  |[Mirror Grote 12.44 -33% $12.81
40700 Grommeat Grole 1.08 -33% $1.12
|
43411-3  fPermit Holder Grote 1,79 -33% §1.84
|
45413 Light Grote 2.04 -33% $2.10
i
50232 Light Grote 3.82 -33% $3.93
64930 Housing Grote 5.47 -33% $5.63
16-726 Trailer Sockat Phillips 7.44[Plus 12% $7.66
|
16-730 Trailer Sccket Phillips 6.84|Plus 12% §7.05
|
7-241 Battery Terminal Phillips no bid nc bid no bid |
82323 Oil Gage Stewart Warner 45.16 [Plus 11% $48.51
82354 Qil Gage Stewart Warner A46.02 |Plus 11% $47 .40
391D-D Fuel Sender Stewart Warner 32.47 - $33.44
54150 Socket Pico 3.30 - $3.40
|
5744C Connector Plco 1o bid [ no bid
58600 Terminal Pico 3 0.35 [Plus 11% $0.36
12010996/Maney |
B7123 Fuse Block Hella $ 3.08 [Plus 11% $3.17
|
87401 Retay Hella $ 5.65 | -2% $5.83
15-8271/AC Delco
87423 Relay Hella 3 10.75 { -2% $11.07
D1727A/AC Delco
12082 Trailer Plug Cole Hersee $ 10,17 -22% $10.48
|
1235 Trailer Plug Cole Hersee $ 7.29 -22% $7.51
|
24106 Solenoid Cole Hersee 3 13.77 -22% $14.18
|
50002 Switch Ccle Hersee 5 9,81 -22% $10.10
: I
54012 Rocker Switch Cole Hersee $ 210 -22% $2.16
|
00197 Ballery Carrier Ceka $ 10.48 |Plus 11% §10.79
06188 Battery Hold Down [Deka [ 13,07 |Plus 11% $13.46
325GM Spotlight Unity ] 113.96 |Plus 11% $117.38
325H Spoflight Unity 113.96 |Plus 11% §117.38
G701-0101 [Spotlight Handle  [Unity 29.31 |Plus 11% $30.19
10251R__ |Marker Light Trucklite £.09 -5% $6.27
i
10251Y Marker Light Trucklite $ 8.46 -5% $6.65
|
97727 Mirror Bracket Trucklite 5 38.88 [Plus 11% $40.06
1196 Bulb Wagner 3 2.72 |Plus 11% $2,80
HB054 Headlight Wagner $ 10.15 [Plus 11% $10.45
8015 Lamp Wagner $ 6.56 {Plus 11% $6.75
600932 Wirrar Retrac [ 28.63 |Plus 11% $20.49
610216 Mirror Head Retrac $ 11.94 [Plus 11% $12.30
9003 Lamp CEC $ 592 |Plus 11% $6.10
|
8005 Lamp CEC $ 4.96 |Plus 11% $5.11
|
BB2000 Sealbeam Cptrenics $ 23.00 [Pius 11% $23.69
A5110 Lamp Optranics no bid no bid
530 Back Up Alarm ECCO 3 10.18 -45% $10.49
599297 Velpac |
K30 Larmp Osram [ 6.21 [Plus 11% $6.40
|
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Contract #33300; Renewal No, 2
(11/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

Multi AutoPartsAC Delco H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
Cost to City { Discount Percantage 2016-2017 Pricing
10231 Radlator Cap Stant $ 2.45] -30%1 § 2,82
10413 Fuel Cap Stant 3 25.72 -30%} § 26.49
10817 Fuel Cap Stant 3 3.46 | -30%| 8 3.56
6802 Spark Plug Wires Standard | § 34.23 | Plus 11%] § 35,26
DR37 Ignition Coil Stapdard 5 38.82 Plus 11% 39.98
FD168 Distributor Cap Standard 18,96 Plus 11%] § 19.63
RY30 Relay Standard 10.52 Plus 11%| 10.84
us14 Ignition Switch Standard 18.34 Plus 11%| § 18.89
34832 Shock Absarber Monrae 24.27 -34%| § 25,00
34733 Shock Absorber Monroe 3 29.26 | -34%| § 30.14
560055 Shack Absorber Monroe $ 57.76 | -34%| $ £9.49
DS89g Center Link Moog $ 17.81] Plus 8%; § 18.34
48B1098A/AC Delco
ES2019RLT {Quier Tie Rod Moog [ 5.08 | Plus 6%]| $ 5.24
458A0184A/AC Delco
K8283 Idler Arm Moog $ 12.02 ] Plus 6%| § 12.38
46C1042A/AC Delco
5-153X, U-Joint Spicer [ 5.22 ] -2%| 5.38
45U0107/AC Delco
6-4-4561 End Yoke Spicer NB NB
AWT 160 Water Pump Alrtex $ 36,35 -2%| § 36.41
25 FTEIIRC Uelee
AWL049 Water Pump Airtex ] 23.21] -2%] $ 23.81
AT TR Deic
21-22 Wiper Blades Anco 5 348 ] -4%] 3.58
8-4422/AC Delco
31-18 Wiper Blades Anco 3 348 4% § 3.58
8-4416/AC Delco
0332209150 [Relay Bosch 3 4,65 | -22%|} $ 4.79
RC400112NN/Cclehers
13133 02 Sensor’ Bosch $ 3045 ] -2%[ § 31.36
213-1317/AC Delco
15718 02 Sensor Bosch 5 33.23 1 -2%| § 34.23
213-1460/AC Dejco
594-017 Harmonic Bajancer  {Dorman $ 56.51 -65% 58,21
51767 Mirror Glass Darman 5 8.23 -65%)| § B.48
510-368 Wheal Stud Dorman 5 1.1 -65% 1.14
654-234 Muffler Clamp Dorman NB NB
15-1751 Accumulator ACDelco [ § 14.15 2% § 14.57
18-20189 AC Compressor ACDelco [§ 147.62 2%l § 152.05
1104032 Distributor AC Deleo [ 250.00 -2%] § 257.50
19212300/ AC Delco
15-5378 Crifice Tutbe ACDelco | $ 2.02 | -2%]| $ 2.08
15-60063 Heater Core AC Delce [ $ 110.27 -2%| % 113.58
15-62547 Heater Core ACDelco |3 56.68 -2%| $ 58.38
20803 Radiator AC Delco $ 226.71 2% $ 233.51
213-939 QOxygen Sensor AC Delco [ § 33,64 -2%j § 34.65
22127653 Washer Pump AC Delco | $ 30.33 -2%} § 31.24
89025062/AC Delco
CR43TS Spark Plug AC Delco 1.23 2%| § 1.27
718K Spark Plug Wire Sst [AC Delco | $ 24,09 -2%| § 2481
§718K/AC Delco
D303A Distributor Cap AC Delco | § 18,18 -2%| § 16.67
10479814 Starer ACDelco | § 271.23 |Plus 7% 3 278.37
16473614/Delco Remy
323-485 Starter AC Delco $ 108.35 2% § 111.60
323-773 Starier AC Delco 220.12 2%] & 226.72
323-867 Starter ACDelcc | & 180.03 Plus 7%| $ 195,79
) 10461052/ Delco Remy
321-1107 Alternator AG Delce [ $ £9.22 | -2%) $ 71.30
334-2454A/AC Delco
321-740 Alterator ACDelcn |3 164.73 [Plus 7% 3 169.67
8600310/Delco Remy
321-1101 Alternator AC Delco [ 3 72.23 | -2%[ $ 74.40
334-2451AJAC Delco
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Contract #33300; Renewal No. 2

{11/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

Chemicals
H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta
Cost to City Riscount Percentage 2016-2017 Pricing
2116 Red Paint Krylen 3.78 plus 11%] $ 3.86
1908 Blue Paint Krylon § 342 plus 11%)]| $ 3.52
08877 Silicone Lubricant M g 5,25 plus 11% S.41
08987 General Adhesive M § 6.92 pius 11% 713
2613 Transmission Fluid McKay $ 3.26 -25% 3.36
CRC/SL2651
909 Ignition Kote iMcKay  |[NB NB
82655 JB Weld JBWeld [§ 4.80 plus 1%} § 4,94
B2190 Super Glue Parmatex | § 0.83 -30%| § 0.85
81724 Blue RTV Permatex | $ 3.11 -30%| § 3.20
10160 Cleaner Armorall 5.59 plus 11%| $ 576
30200 Cleaner Armorall 3.44 plus 11%[ 8 3.54
0111 Lubricant WDA0 4.51 plus 11%| $ 4.65
05017 Disc Brake Quiet CRC $ 3.38 ~25% 3.48
05084 Brake Cleaner CRC $ 2.66 -25% 2,74
31.2631 Power Steering Fluid  [CRC $ 2.86 -25%| § 2.895
16PB Luhbricant PowerBlag $ 3.51 plus 11%] $ 3.62
M506 Windshield Solvent Gunk $ 0.99 plus 11%| $ 1.02
M3815 Starting Fluid Gunk § 2.13] -25%] § 2.19
CRC/56T1
M5212 Fuei [njecticn Cieaner |Gunk 3 1.77 | -25%| § 1.82
CRC/5081

2234 Dot 3 Brake Fluid Johnsen | § 13.41 | plus 11%| § 13.51

\Wagner/FC134282
2613 Special Trans Fluid Johnsen | % 3,26 | -25%| § 3.36

CRC/SL2651

83637 15040 QT Chevron_ | § 2.7¢ |plus 5% $ 2,87

AC Delcof10-9042
98399N Synthetic Ol 5W30 Mohil 3 5.25 [plus 5% 3 541

AC Delco/10-9036
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Genaral Auto Body AC Delco

Contract #33300; Renawal No. 2
(11/29/2016 fo 11/28/2017)

ER Minimum | Minimum Approx Miniraum H& H Auto Parts Whaelsale
Dimensional 20 Hour Cold Minimum | Reserve Arleta
20162017 Pricing | 20162017 Core

SizesiSeries Rating Amerage Weight {Minutes) Unit Price| Core Price

UI-L{H-8 87 270 191BS 30 E] 3498 [ § 1760 | § 3603 § 11.00
Brand Offerad:Centennial 330 40 AC Delco/U1300

8D 234 1050 A5LBS 360 $ 11121 ]s 4785 1% 11455 | § 31.00
Brand Offered:Centennial 1200 . 400 ACDELCO  8DA

22NF-5 34 350 2588 70 3 41003 35 1780 [ 3 4223 | § 11.60
Brand Offered:Centennlal 390 70 ACDELCO 251

24-6 60 525 38 LBS g5 $ 4209} § 176048 433513 11.60
Brand Offered:Centennial 550 130 AC Delsoiz4p

24C-7 700 45 | BS 135 ] 6274 § 1760 | § 6462 § 11.00
Brand Cffered:Centennial 720 150 AC Delcof24PG

24F-6 60 525 37 LBS a5 ] 47008 1760 | % 4335 % 11.00
Brand Offered:Centennial 550 130 AC Delcof24RP

27-5 71 700 45 LBS 135 $ 6b 17 [ § 1760 § 8713 ¢ 1.00
Brand Offered:Centennial 800 160 AC Deleo/27PG

27C-7 700 45 LBS 130 3 63.67 [ $ 1760 % 45.58 | & 11.00
Brand Offersd:Centenniai 700 180 AC Delcol27RPG

27F-5 71 5640 44 |.BS 108 [ 54.9‘3_| 3 1760 | % 56.58 | § 11.00
Brand Offered:Centennial 500 160 AC Delco/ACD2760

27RVX 27/DC6 650 51LBS 145 § 64638 17.60 | $ 66.57 | § 11.00
Brand Offered: Centennfal 700 180 AC Delco/M27MF

27DCE 94 850 51LBS 145 $ 5883 1§ 176018 6059 | § 11.00
I_Eranc Offered:Centannial 700 180 AC Delco/DC27 .

30H-4 95 650 56 LBS 160 $ B8.55 [ § 17604 § 70611 % 11.00
Brand Offerad:Centennial 800 170 AC Delco/MZOMF

31P-5 93 750 56 IBS 170 E 57,85 [ § 2860 (8§ 58.59 | $ 18.50
Brand Qffered;Cantennial 800 180 AC Deleo/ACD1109C

34-787 800 45 L3S 145 3 6223 [ § 17680 [ § 6410 | § 11.00
Brand Offered:Centeninial 800 145 AC Delcof78DTPS

70-6 50 500 38 LBS g0 E] 42003 17608 4335 | § 11.00
Brand Offered:Centennlal 520 o AC Daleo/rOP

31HD-S7 S00 62188 1g0 3 6712 |8 2860 |3 69.14 | 5 18.50
Brand Offered:Centennial 826 00 AC Dalco/ACD3ITS

58-R6P 600 341BS 00 3 58.07 [ 3 1760 [ § 59.81 | § 11.00
Brand Cffered:Centennlal 610 00 AC Delco/58RPS

55-8YR 850 45 LBS S50 E] 63.21]3 17.60 | § 6511 [§ 11.00
AC DELCO OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Qffered: AC Delco

Brand Offered:CENTENNIAL 850 140

65-7YR §50 45 LBS 160 § 7081 % 178048 728318 11.00
AC DELCO OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Offered: AC Delco

Brand Offered:CENTENNIAL 850 1€0

75-7YR 735 35LBS 100 3 6425 [ § 1760 | § 66.16 | 5 11.60
AC DELCO OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Cffered: AC Delco

Brand Qffersd:CENTENNIAL

74-8YR b25 40 1BS 95 E 56.35 | % 17.60 | § 58.04 | § 11.00
AC DELCC OR "APPROVED EQUAL"

Brand Offered: CENTENNIAL 525 98

78-6YR 550 35 LBS 100 3 42.09 | 3 1760 | % 4235 | § 11.0C
[AC DELCG OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Offerad; AC Deico

Brand Offered: CENTENNIAL 710 110

78-7YR 770 28 LBS 120 § 6767 1% 1760 [ % 8870 1S 11.00
AC DELGO OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Offered: AC Delco

Brand Offered:CENTENNIAL 800 110 |

78DT-TYR 850 42 [BS 115 $ 70.07 | § 17.60 [ § 7217 [ § 11.00
AC DELCO OR "APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Offered: AC Dalco

Brand Cifered:CENTENNIAL 850 120

78-8YR 6875 3BLBS 100 [] 5880 | § 1760 § B0.56 | § 11.00
AC DELCO OR “APPROVED EQUAL" Brand Offered: AC Delco

Brand Offered:CENTENNIAL 710 110
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Contract #33300; Renewal No.

(11/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

Trojan
H3 H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta

Ampere .
Part Numher Voits | Hours Length | Width | Height| Price Core Price 2016-2017 Pricing 2016-2017 Cora Price
BD-AGM 12 230 20.5" 10.57" 18.9" $523.21 (% 28.60 538.811 8% 18.50
Brand Offered: TROJAN
31-AGM 12 110 13.1" 6.9" |8.69" $251.51 (% 28.60 259.06 | § 18.50
Brand Offered: TROJAN .
J150 12 150 13.81" 7" 10.9" $13692|8% 28,60 141031 % 43,50
Brand Offered: TROJAN
T-105 6 225 10.4" 713" |10.8" $126.71 [ % 28,60 13051 ( % 21,00
Brand Otfered: TROJAN
T-125 6 235 10.4" 7.13" 110.9" $144.26 | & 28,60 148.59 [ & 24.00

Brand Offered:TROJAN
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LContract #33300; Renewal No. 2
($1/29/2016 to 11/28/2017)

QOdyssey & Optima

H& H Auto Parts Whoelsale
Arleta

Part Number/Series | Unit Price Core Price 2016-2017 Pricing |2016-2017 Core Price

PC310 181.851 % 28.60 187.41 $18.50
PCE35 13595 % 28.60 $140.03 $18.50
PC545 137,95 28.60 $142.09 18.50
PC825 106.95 23.60 $110.16 18.50
PGB0 145.95 28.60 160.33 18.560
PC925 183.95 | § 28,60 189.47] 18.50
PC1200 22295 1§ 28.80 229.64 18.50
PC1230 281.956 28.60 5200.41 18.50
PC1400 b 279.95 28.60 5288.35 18.50
PC1500 278.85 28.60 5287.32 18.60
PC1700T/MJT 374.85 28.60 5386.20 18.50
PC1750 308.95 | & 26.50 318.25 $18.50
PC2150 $ 377.95 28.60 389,29 18.50
PC2250 § 514951 28,60 530.40 $18.50
BY § 10145 % 17.60 $104.49 $17.60
25 b 124.46 17.60 $128.18 ji7.60
35 }  124.46 17.60 128.18 517.80
34 130,95 17.80 134.88 517.60
34R 13065 [ § 17.80 134.88 §17.60
7525 127.41 17.60 p131.23 517.60
34/78 13085 % 17.60 5134.88 17.60
34M $ 137441% 17.60 141.56 17.60
D34 $ 153,86 § 17.60 158.58 $17.60
D31M $ 186.41 28.60 192.00 18.50
D34/78 156.81 17.60 161.62 $17.60
D34 153.96 17.60 158.58 17.60
D51 130.95 17.60 b134.58 $17.60
D51R 130.95 17.60 134.88 $17.60
D31T b 19290 | % 25.60 198,69 518.50
D31A 192.90 28.60 198.69 §18.50
D35 150.42 17.60 154.83 §17.80
D75/25 $ 150421% 17.80 164.93 517.60
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