AMENDMENT NO. ONE TO CONTRACT NO. 36034

- 36034
RE: Amendment One of ITB FS 21-077, Contract No. 36034 for the purchase of Cummins & Detroit
Engine Parts and Repair Services for the City of Long Beach (Munis Contract 32101069)

This Amendment to Contract No. 36034 is made and entered as of June 14, 2023, by and between the CITY
OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and Cummins, Inc dba Cummins Sales and Service.

Contract No. 36034 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as mdrcated below by a check or
other mark preceding the appropriate amendment:

X 1. The term is extended to September 30, 2024

X__ 2.$150,000 has been added to the 1st renewal term for a total contract amount for all years of the
Agreement not to exceed $400,000 in the aggregate.

3. Prices during this period shall remain firm.

X 4, The price for this Agreement shall be amended and replaced by the rates and charges as shown in
Exhibit “A", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.

5. The pricing this Agreement shall be amended to include the rates and charges as shown on Exhibit “A”,
which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.

6. The discount offered to the City is increased by %

7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit “B”, which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract.

8. The locations identified on Exhibit “B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby added to the Contract

9. Current permits, licenses, insurance, and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1.
Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions.in this Contract are ratified and confirmed and

remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated above.
Attach Notary if Qut-of-State Contractor

CONTRACTOR: PATRICIAROBLES [
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THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

By: /{Mfw{w j- gchMrvn fo R Approved ad to 0

THOMAS B. MODICA, City Manager Dawn Mclintgsh, City Attorney
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THE CITY CHARTER,



ExhibitA

Quantity| Reference| Manufacturer Medel Num Brand Requirement Brand Spec 2023 Pricing 2024 Pricing
" *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
10 Cummins 3944696 $105.82 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$183.89 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
. “The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
19 Ciimming 5284303 $59.12 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$91.87 3-10% oft MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
" " *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varles by
13 Cummins 3800974 814493 New P/N: 5473301 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$292.32 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
5 . *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
2 Cummins 4376358 $167.93 New PA\: 8410357 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$282.54 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
10 Detyoit 8922383 Not a cummins # Not a cummins # NO BID
25 Detrolt 23539802 Not a cummins # Net a cummins # NO BID
. *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
100 Cummins 5310989 $163.27 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$265.83 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
Based on TSB170128 PN | Based on TSB170128 PN
N Supercedes, please cantact | Supercedes, please contact
100 Cummins 4855850 $35.32 your account executive your account executive
before placing the order. before placing the order.
< *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
20 Cummins 432656 $54.31 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$98.79 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
20 Detroit P23519307 Not a cummins # Not a cummins # NO BID
5 F ;. *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
2 Cummins 5310990 $159.85 New.PN::5626358 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$253.30 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the Jocal Cummins service center paris personnel.
10 Detroit 23537304 Not a cummins # Not a cummins # NO BID
o *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
30 Cumpmins, 2473010 $35.32 part. Far up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$63.14 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts personnel.
" *The discount range is between 3-10% off MSRP, but the specific discount varies by
10 Cummins 4001675 5627.94 part. For up-to-the-minute pricing, please contact your Cummins Account Executive
$1,008.51 3-10% off MSRP* (Kurt Hintz) or the local Cummins service center parts pefsonnel.
Quantity| Reference| Manufacturer Model Num Brand Requirement 2023 Pricing 2024 Pricing
1 $176.00 $235.00 $246.75 per hour
$ 264 fort the first 4 $255 for the first 4 hours, |$267.75 per hour for the first
1 hours. Anything after after that it would be $275 | 4 hours, after that it would
3 ____perhour | be $288.75 per hour
$258 per hour for Saturday |$267.75 per hour {or the first
1 stgzga;usiszc;ay. and $275 per hour for 4 hours, after that it would
d Y Sunday be $288.75 per hour
1 $352 $275 per Hour $288.75 per hour
Submitz as 514'225'93 45 Hours plus applicable 45 Hours plus applicable
10 Cummins 42 hours Partsiand LaborCast:$ parts pricing parts pricing
14,225.03
Labor Cost: § 7,568.00 Labor Cost: $10,575 Labor Cost: §11,103.75
tow : we will use an tow : we will use an outside | tow : we will use an outside
1 outside vendor to vendor to have vehicles vendor to have vehicles
have vehicles towed. towed. towed.




Annual Alloc Transfer Cummins Detroit Engine pts svc first renewal.xlsx

Contract Period 10/1/2021 - 9/30/2022 10/1/2022 - 9/30/2023 10/1/2023 - 9/30/2024
Year 1 Year- Year 2 Year 2 Year- Year 3 Year 3 Year-
MUNIS Year 1 Initial Year1 End Initial Year 2 End Initial Year3 End
Vendor Name Contract Allocation Transfers | Allocation | Allocation | Transfers Allocation | Allocation | Transfers| Allocation
Cummins, Inc. 32101069 125,000 125,000 250,000 150,000 - -
L.A. Truck Centers, LLC 32200068 75,000 75,000 150,000 75,000 225,000 150,000 -
Performance Truck Repair 32101124 125,000 (75,000) 125,000 175,000 25,000 -
Total Allocated 325,000 325,000 650,000 325,000 -
Unallocated 48,750 48,750 97,500 48,750
Total 373,750 - 373,750 747,500 373,750 373,750
*Authorized annual agrregate CCL amount 9/7/21: $325,000
with 15% contingency $48,750 | | |

Annual Alloc Transfer Cummins Detroit Engine pts svc first renewal.xlsx
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