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Stephanie Sosa

From: Eloise Parker <gpcarepackages@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 11:28 AM
To: Stephanie Sosa
Subject: Re: Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application - Eloise ParkerGP 

Carepackages and Blankets of Love
Attachments: image003.png

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

-EXTERNAL- 

 
Great, thank you so much! That would be just fine. Thank u again and feel free to call me anytime. I'm new at this,  so I 
would like to speak with you also. Have a great day Eloise  
 
On Fri, Apr 28, 2023, 10:23 AM Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov> wrote: 

Hello Eloise,  

  

I have received your separate emails and will work on compiling it into one.  

I may have further clarifying questions once I have a chance to thoroughly review the submitted documentation. 

  

Additionally, I will use this email to change your request from “Reimbursement” to “Advanced Payment”. 

Please note that an advanced payment is for half of the total requested amount, in this case it would be $2,500). 

  

Have a great weekend and I will reach out sometime next week. 

  

Thank you,  

  

Stephanie Sosa 

Contracts and Grants Associate  

Pronouns: She, Her, Hers 
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Health and Human Services Department 

1301 W. 12th Street | Long Beach, CA 90813 

Office: 562.570.4182  

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.
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From: Eloise Parker <gpcarepackages@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 10:00 AM 
To: Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov> 
Subject: Re: Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application - Eloise ParkerGP Carepackages and Blankets of 
Love 

  

-EXTERNAL- 

  

Stephanie, I started GP Carepackages and Blankets of Love in 2014, as a way of helping the homeless. We put together 
packages that includes. Hygienic items, socks, beanies,gloves, blankets, tshirts and even $10 gift cards for food. During 
the Christmas season we add shoes, tents and clothes. We also, put together food packages, that have sustainable food 
with water included. We do this to show love for someone that might be in need or is homeless. Please let me know if 
you have any questions or concerns. Warm regards and I'll send the break down soon of price points. Can we also 
change the option to receive funds pay in advance?Can you give me a call at 562-200-5978 Eloise  

  

On Thu, Apr 27, 2023, 8:44 AM Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov> wrote: 

Hello Eloise, 

  

Unfortunately, there is no way to edit the application, but you can send the two items directly to me and I will put 
it together. 
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Thank you,  

  

Stephanie Sosa 

Contracts and Grants Associate  

Pronouns: She, Her, Hers 

  

Health and Human Services Department 

1301 W. 12th Street | Long Beach, CA 90813 

Office: 562.570.4182  

  

 

    

  

From: Eloise Parker <gpcarepackages@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 8:38 PM 
To: Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov> 
Subject: Re: Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application - Eloise ParkerGP Carepackages and Blankets of 
Love 

  

-EXTERNAL- 

  

Stephanie, Is there a way of editing the application? Or, can  send the information via email? Eloise  

  

On Wed, Apr 26, 2023, 8:33 PM Eloise Parker <gpcarepackages@gmail.com> wrote: 

I will get this to you ASAP.  

  

On Wed, Apr 26, 2023, 6:39 PM Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov> wrote: 

Hello Eloise,  
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Thank you for applying.  I did a quick threshold review and noted that we did not receive : 

  

STATEMENT OF NEED (ONE-PAGE MAXIMUM) - This is usually a narrative of how you started the organization 
and what your proposed project will do 

COST BREAKDOWN OF PROPOSED PROJECT (ONE-PAGE MAXIMUM)- This is a line-item budget listing the cost 
per items. As well as how many expected items or care packages are expected to be purchased  

  

If you could please, provide that information the staff will be able to do a more thorough review. 

  

Thank you,  

  

Stephanie Sosa 

Contracts and Grants Associate  

Pronouns: She, Her, Hers 

  

Health and Human Services Department 

1301 W. 12th Street | Long Beach, CA 90813 

Office: 562.570.4182  

  

    

  

From: HomelessServices <HomelessServices@longbeach.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 8:43 AM 
To: Stephanie Sosa <Stephanie.Sosa@longbeach.gov>; Alvin Teng <Alvin.Teng@longbeach.gov> 
Subject: FW: Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application - Eloise ParkerGP Carepackages and Blankets 
of Love 
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Walter Smith 

Outreach Dispatcher 

Health and Human Services Department 

Multi-Services Center 

1301 W. 12th Street | Long Beach, CA 90813 

Office: 562.570.4522 |Fax: 562.570.8234 

   

  

From: City of Long Beach Homeless Services Bureau <notifications@cognitoforms.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2023 8:41 AM 
To: HomelessServices <HomelessServices@longbeach.gov> 
Subject: Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application - Eloise ParkerGP Carepackages and Blankets of 
Love 

  

-EXTERNAL- 

  

City of Long Beach Homeless Services Bureau 
Mayor's Fund to End Homelessness Funding Application 

  

 View full entry at CognitoForms.com.  
 

 

  

Open Form 
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Entry Details 

  

Funding Application 

ORGANIZATION GP Carepackages and Blankets of Love 

501(C)(3) NUMBER 845014100 

NAME Eloise Parker 

EMAIL gpcarepackages@gmail.com  

PHONE (562) 200-5978 

ADDRESS 2131 1/2 Pacifuc ave #3, LONG BEACH, California 
90806 

Organizational Experience: 

STATE THE NUMBER OF YEARS 
YOUR ORGANIZATION HAS BEEN 
SERVING PEOPLE EXPERIENCING 
HOMELESSNESS: 

9 

STATE THE NUMBER OF PERSONS 
YOUR ORGANIZATION SERVES IN AN 
AVERAGE MONTH: 

300 

DESCRIBE THE SERVICES YOUR 
ORGANIZATION PROVIDE: 

We provide hygienic products, food, blankets 

LIST ALL SUBPOPULATIONS SERVED 
BY YOUR ORGANIZATION: 

All in need, no specific demographic 

Request Information: 
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AMOUNT OF FUNDING REQUESTED: $5,000.00 

SUMMARIZE YOUR PROPOSED 
PROJECT: 

We would like to continue passing out blankets and 
carepackages, provide food,shoes and tents. 
Location would be the 14th st park in Long Beach. 

ARE YOU APPLYING FOR FUNDS ON 
A REIMBURSEMENT OR PAYMENT IN 
ADVANCE BASIS? 

Reimbursement 

Supporting Documentation 

STATEMENT OF NEED (ONE-
PAGE MAXIMUM) 

 

COST BREAKDOWN OF 
PROPOSED PROJECT (ONE-
PAGE MAXIMUM) 

 

NON-PROFIT ENTITY STATUS 
LETTER 

20230308_150422.jpg 

PROOF OF ADDRESS IN LONG 
BEACH 

20230313_180443.jpg 

OTHER SUPPORTING 
DOCUMENTATION 

IMG_1718001.jpg 

Signature and Acknowledgement 

NAME Eloise Parker 

SIGNATURE Captured 

DATE 4/24/2023 
 

  
 

 

  

  

This communication may contain confidential Protected Health Information. This information is intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity to which it is addressed. The authorized recipient of this information is prohibited from disclosing this information to any other party 
unless required to do so by law or regulation and is required to destroy the information after its stated need has been fulfilled. If you are not 
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the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of these 
documents is STRICTLY PROHIBITED by Federal law. If you have received this information in error, please notify the sender immediately and 
arrange for the return or destruction of these documents.  


