

AMENDMENT NO. ONE TO CONTRACT NO. 34716 34716

RE: **Renewal No. One of Contract No. 34716 (ITB LB17-063) for Furnishing and Delivering Miscellaneous Apparel to the City of Long Beach (3180000002, formerly BPLB18000002)**

This Amendment to Contract No. 34716 is made and entered as of July 1, 2019 by and between the CITY OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and **Fernando's Screen Printing, Inc.** (Contractor).


Contract No. 34716 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as indicated below by a check or other mark preceding the appropriate amendment:

- 1. First Renewal option extending term to September 30, 2020.
- 2. No money added.
- 3. Prices during this period shall remain firm.
- 4. The price for certain items shall be increased as shown on Exhibit "A", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.
- 5. The price for certain items shall be decreased as shown on Exhibit "A", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.
- 6. The discount offered to the City is increased by ____ %
- 7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract.
- 8. The locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference, are hereby added to the Contract.
- 9. Current permits, licenses, insurance and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1.


Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions in this Contract are ratified and confirmed and remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated above.

Attach Notary if Out-of-State Contractor


CONTRACTOR:


(Signature)
Daniel Campero Larius
(Print / Type Name)
President Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one)

CONTRACTOR:


(Signature)
Daniel Campero Larius
(Print / Type Name)
President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one)

THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

By: 
City Manager

Tom Modica
Assistant City Manager
EXECUTED PURSUANT
TO SECTION 301 OF
THE CITY CHARTER

Approved as to form:
CHARLES PARKIN, City Attorney

3018 2EB 73 64
By: 
Deputy

Exhibit A

**Contract 34716
Amendment No. One**



FAMILY OWNED - QUALITY PRODUCTS
EMBROIDERY - PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS - SCREEN PRINTING

July 16, 2018

To Whom It May Concern,

I am writing to you to inform you that prices will increase by 8%, 3% base and 5% renewal increase. The reason for this is that cost of product and labor cost has increased since 2017. Therefore, to accommodate the increase will have to increase all prices by 8%.

During this time, I would like take the opportunity to update our information. Our new address is 11331 Markon Dr, Garden Grove, CA 92841. Our e-mail is Daniel@FernandosPrint.com or if there's no response please e-mail the front desk at Lety@FernandosPrint.com. As for our telephone and fax number they remain the same.

Thank you for your time and if you have any questions, please feel free to contact our office at any time at (714) 723-0125.

Sincerely,

Daniel Campero
Founder and President
Fernando's Screen Printing
11331 Markon Dr
Garden Grove, CA 92841
Tel: (714) 723-0125
Fax: (714) 723-0063
www.FernandosScreenPrintingInc.com

Thank you for your business!!

Phone: (714) 723-0125
Fax: (714) 723-0063
Toll Free: (844) 873-8894

www.FernandosPrint.com
Daniel@FernandosPrint.com

11331 Markon Dr.
Garden Grove, CA 92841

CITYWIDE APPAREL BID #LB 17-063 - FERNANDO'S SCREEN PRINTING

Item Code		Description	SIZE	Unit	Renewal 1 Price % Increase	
APPAREL - T-SHIRTS (ALL COLOR OPTIONS AVAILABLE)						
Tee Shirt - Adult - 6 oz. (Ultra Cotton)	Gildan 100% Cotton or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Adult - 6 oz. (Ultra Cotton)	Gildan 100% Cotton or approved equal	2XL	\$4.50	\$4.86	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Adult 6 oz. Ultra Cotton 50/50	Gildan or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.55	\$2.75	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Adult 6 oz. Ultra Cotton 50/50	Gildan or approved equal	2XL	\$4.55	\$4.91	8.00%	
Long Sleeve Tee Shirt - Adult 6 oz 50/50	Gildan or approved equal	S-XL	\$5.75	\$6.21	8.00%	
Long Sleeve Tee Shirt - Adult 6 oz 50/50	Gildan or approved equal	2XL	\$5.75	\$6.21	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Adult - 6 oz.	Hanes Tagless or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.25	\$2.43	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Adult - 6 oz.	Hanes Tagless or approved equal	2XL	\$4.25	\$4.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 6 oz. (Ultra Cotton)	Gildan 100% Cotton or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 6 oz. (Ultra Cotton)	Gildan 100% Cotton or approved equal	2XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 50/50 Poly/Cotton	Gildan 100% Cotton or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 50/50 Poly/Cotton	Gildan 50/50 Poly/Cotton or approved equal	2XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 6 oz. 100% Cotton Tagless	Gildan 50/50 Poly/Cotton or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 6 oz. 100% Cotton Tagless	Hanes 100% Cotton Tagless or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 6 oz. 100% Cotton Tagless	Hanes 100% Cotton Tagless or approved equal	2XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 50/50 Poly/Cotton	Hanes 50/50 Poly/Cotton or approved equal	S-XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt - Youth - 50/50 Poly/Cotton	Hanes 50/50 Poly/Cotton or approved equal	2XL	\$2.40	\$2.59	8.00%	
Tee Shirt	Sport-Tek Dry Zone L473 or approved equal	S-XL	\$8.05	\$8.69	8.00%	
Tee Shirt	Sport-Tek Dry Zone L473 or approved equal	2XL	\$9.25	\$9.99	8.00%	
Tee Shirt	Sport-Tek Dry Zone T473 or approved equal	S-XL	\$8.05	\$8.69	8.00%	
Tee Shirt	Sport-Tek Dry Zone T473 or approved equal	2XL	\$9.25	\$9.99	8.00%	
Tee Shirt (Charcoal)	Port & Company LPC61 or approved equal	S-XL	\$3.10	\$3.35	8.00%	
Tee Shirt (Charcoal)	Port & Company LPC61 or approved equal	2XL	\$4.15	\$4.48	8.00%	
Tee Shirt (Deep Marine and Charcoal)	Port Authority PC61 or approved equal	S-XL	\$3.40	\$3.67	8.00%	
Tee Shirt (Deep Marine and Charcoal)	Port Authority PC61 or approved equal	2XL	\$5.15	\$5.56	8.00%	

Fernando's Screen Printing Inc.
Contract #34716

CITYWIDE APPAREL BID #LB 17-063 - FERNANDO'S SCREEN PRINTING

Item Code		Description	SIZE	Fernando's Screen Printing Inc. Contract #34716	
SCREEN PRINTING				Unit	
		Setup fee for screen printing - one color		\$10.00	\$10.80
		Setup fee for screen printing - two color		\$20.00	\$21.60
		Setup fee for screen printing - three color		\$30.00	\$32.40
		Setup fee for screen printing - four color		\$40.00	\$43.20
		Setup fee for screen printing - five color		\$50.00	\$54.00
		Setup fee for screen printing - six color		\$60.00	\$64.80
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - one color		\$0.75	\$0.81
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - two color		\$0.95	\$1.03
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - three color		\$1.15	\$1.24
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - four color		\$1.35	\$1.46
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - five color		\$1.55	\$1.67
		Cost for Screen Printing Decoration - six color		\$1.75	\$1.89
VINYL					
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - one color		no bid	
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - two color		no bid	
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - three color		no bid	
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - four color		no bid	
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - five color		no bid	
		Setup fee for Custom Cut Vinyl - six color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - one color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - two color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - three color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - four color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - five color		no bid	
		Cost for vinyl decoration - six color		no bid	

CITYWIDE APPAREL BID #LB 17-063 - FERNANDO'S SCREEN PRINTING

Item Code		Description		SIZE	Fernando's Screen Printing Inc. Contract #34716	
Item Code		Description		SIZE	Unit	
EMBROIDERY						
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 6,000 stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 6,001 - 10,000 stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 10,001 - 15,000 stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 15,001 - 20,000 stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 20,001 - 25,000 stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for embroidery/monogramming items per item (e.g. name per letter) up to 25,001 and over stitches				\$35.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 6,000 stitches				\$5.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 6,001 - 10,000 stitches				\$5.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 10,001 - 15,000 stitches				\$6.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 15,001 - 20,000 stitches				\$6.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 20,001 - 25,000 stitches				\$7.00	8.00%
	Cost for embroidery decoration up to 25,001 and over stitches				\$7.00	8.00%
	Embroidery - City Logo 3"x3" 26,000 stitches & 12 colors				\$8.00	8.00%
	One-time Setup fee for City Logo				\$35.00	8.00%
	Cost for City Logo-decoration				\$5.00	8.00%
DELIVERY						
	Rush Charge for orders to be completed within 3 business days				15%	0.00%
	Rush Charge for orders to be completed within 1 business day				25%	0.00%
	Standard order				0%	0.00%
DISCOUNT						
	Discount offered for items not listed in specifications				5%	0%