
AMENDMENT NO. TWO TO CONTRACT NO. 3469634596

RE: Amendment Two of ITB FS 17-037, Contract No. 34596 for providing as needed petroleum
products to the City of Long Beach (Munis Contract #3172200040 formerly BPFM17000040) 

This Amendment to Contract No. 34596 is made and entered as of March 29, 2020 by and between the
CITY OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and Southern Counties Oil Company a California
Limited Partnership dba SC Fuels

Contract No. 34596 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as indicated below by a check or
other mark preceding the appropriate amendment: 

X 1. 2nd renewal option for the term 05/01/ 2020 to 04/30/2021

X 2. Adding $250,000 for term

3. Prices during this period shall remain firm. 

x 4. The price for certain items shall be increased as shown on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto
and incorporated herein by this reference. 

5. The price for certain items shall be decreased as shown on Exhibit "C", which is attached hereto

and incorporated herein by this reference. 

6. The discount offcrcd to the City is increascd by I % 

7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein

by this reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract. 

8. The locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein

by this reference, are hereby added to the Contract. 

9. Current permits, licenses, insurance and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1. 

Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions in this Contract are ratified and confirmed
and remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated
above. 

6ttach Notary if Out -of -State Contractor

CONTRA TOR: 

r

Sign tura) 

Sfeyimn P r; rPinka

Print / Type Name) 

President of Southern Counties Oil Co., GP
President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer

circle one) 

THE CITY OF LONG BE CH: 

By: 
THOMAS B. MO ICA, Acting City Manager

EXECUTED PURSUANT
TO SECTION 301 OF
THE CITY CHARTER

Slgnat re) 

Robert W. Bollar

Print / Type Name) 

Secretary of Southern Counties Oil Co., GP
President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer

circle one) 

Approved as to form: 

CHAR S PA IN, City Attorney

By: 
Deputy
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Year% Year pg Extension

Item Num Section Item Cnde Description Rid Price Unit of Measure Brand Spec Delivery location Increase Increase - Year Pricing
IMotor Oil IConventional; Delivered in55gallon drums 5,78 538 pergallon Performance 50015W-40CA sds 5% 0. 29 6.07

2 Motor Oil IA Conventional; Bulk Delivery In 500 gallon plus lots 5, 445.44 pergallon Performance 500 ISW40 G-0 sds. 5% 0. 27 5,71

3 MoterO(I 113. Conventional; l quart bottles; cases of 12 2.7 2. 70 per. quart CAM2 SUP HO PRM SB ISW40- 12/ 1 QRT ds-sds 5% 0, 14 2. 84

Conventional Low Ash for CNG & LNG engines; Bulk delvery In 500

4 Motor Oil 1C gallon plus lots 632 6, 32 per italign P -SOD LA NGEO ISW40 pds 5% 0.32 6. 64

SMotor Oil 1 2Synthetic; Delivered In 55 gallon drums 7,397,39 per gallon VECrON 15W40 CK4 I 5% 0. 371 7,76

6 Motor Oil 2A Synthetic, Bulk Delivery In 500 gallon plus lots 6. 99 6.99 per gallon VECTON ISW40 CK4 S% O. 3S 7,34

7 Motor 011 2B 5 nthetic• 1 quart bottles; cases of 12 3 3. 00 per quart n a 5% 0,15 3. 15

Synthetic Low Ash for CNG& LNG engines; Bulk delvery In 500
8 Motor Off 2C gallon plus lots _ 7,79 7, 79 per gallon CASTROL DURATEC ES 15W40 ds-sds 5% 0.39 8, 18

9 Motor Oil 3 Synthetic Blend; Delivered In 55 gallon drums 6,096.09pergallon PERF SOO SB15W40., 5% 0.30 6. 39

10 Motor 011, 3A Synthetic Blend; Bulk Delivery In SOO gallon plus lots 5, 74 5. 74 per gallon PERF 500 SB ISW40 _ 5% 0. 29 6. 03

It MotorOil 30 I Synthetic Blend; l quart bottles; cases of 12 272.70per quart CAM25UP HD PRM SB 15W40- 12/ 1 QRT ds- sds 5% 0. 14 2.84

Synthetic Blend Low Ash for CNG & LNG engines; Bulk delvery In
12 Motor 011 3C 500 gallon plus lots No Bid per gallon n/ a No Rid No gid No Bid

13 Motor Oil 4 Re -refined; Delivered InSS gallondrums - - 5. 94 594 per gallon P.S0000 REO SPEC 1SW40 sds 5% 0. 30 6. 24

14 Motor Oil 4A Re- reffned; Bulk DeliverIn500 anon Jus lots S,44 5.44 pergallon - PERF 500 REO HD 1SW40 U-4/$ 1 sds 5% 0. 27 531

15 Motor 011 4B Re -refined; 1 quart bottles; cases of 12 No Old perg.. rt n a No gid No gid No Bid

16 Anti -Wear 5 AW -32 Conventional Bulk Delivery In 200 gallon plus lots 3.39 3. 39 per Lallon Performance 500 PREM HYD AW 32 ods- sds 5% 0. 17 356

17 Anti -Wear SA AW -32 Conventional Delivered In 55 gallon drums 3.79 3.79- per gallon Performance S00 PREMHYD AW 32 ds-sds - 5% 0.39 3. 98

18 Anti -Wear 6AW-32Synthetic Bulk Delivery In 200 gallon plus lots 1185 12.85 pergallon CHEVRON CLARITY SYN AW 32 1 5% 0.64 13.49

19 Anti -Wear 6A AW-32synthetic Delivered in 55 gallon drums 14.75 14.75 per gallon CHEVRON CLARITYSYN AW 32 7% 0.74 1SA9

20 Anti -Wear 7 AW -32 Re -refined Delivered In 55 gallon drums 5.16 5. 16 per gallon IPERF 500 REO HYD AW 32 ds-sds 5% 0.26 5. 42

21 AntFWear 7A AW -32 Re -refined Bulk Delivered In 500 gallon plus lots 5.16 5; 16 per gallon PERF 500 REO HYD AW 32 ds- sds 5% 0,26 5, 42

22 Anti -Wear RAW -68 Conventional BulkDelivery In 200allon. lus lots - 3. 713.71per gallon Performance 500 PREM HYD AW 68 ds- sds 5% 0. 19 390

23 Anti -Wear 8A AW -68 Conventional Delivered In 55 gallon drums 4, 15415 - er anon Performance 500 PREM HYD AW 68 p ds- sds 5% 0, 21 4.36

24 Anti -Wear 9 AW -68 Synthetic Bulk DeliveryIn 200 gallon plus lets 12.85 ] 2. 85 er align CHEVRON CLARITY SYN AW 68 5% 0. 64 13.49

25 AntlVear 9A. AW -68 5yof1ietfcDellvered In SS gallon drums 14.75 14.75 er allon" CHEVRON CLARITY SYN AW 68 5% 0. 74 15.49

26 AntFWear 10 AW-68.Re- relfned Bulk Delivery In 200 gallon plus lots. 5. 3 5. 30 per gallon PERF500 RED NYD.AW 68 ds-sds 5% X0. 27. 5: 57

27 Anti -Wear IDA AW -68 Re -refined Delivered In 55 gallon drums 5.35.30 per, gallon PERF 500 REO HYD AW 68 - s- sds 5% 0.27 5.57

28 Anti -Wear 11 AW -150 Conventional Bulk Delfveryln 200 gallon plus lots 6,76 6.76 pergallon P- 50000 TURBINE 150 5% 0. 34 7. 10

29 Anti -Wear 13A _ AW -150 Conventional Delivered In 55 gallon drums 6,766.76 per, gallon P- S000O TURBINE 150 Sul 0, 34 7. 10

90 AntFWear - - 12 AW -150 Synthetic Bulk Delivery ln? OOgallonpl_us lots 21A921A9per gallon CHEVRON CETUS HIPERSYN 150 5% 1, 07 22.56

11 Anti-Wrnr 17A AW-1505ynthetir Delivered In 55 gallon drnms 214921A9 pot gallon CHEVRON CETUS HIPERSYN 150 1 5% 1. 07 22.56

32 Ant( -Wear 13 AW -150 Re -refined Delivered In 55 gallon drums - No Bid per align _ no bid No Old No Bid - No Bid

33 Antl-Wear 13A AW -150 Re -refined Bulk Delivered In 200 gallon plus lots No Bid per gallon no bid - - - - No gid No old No Bid

Petmlaum-Based;Multf Gear Meeting MIL L2305C-EP, MIL -H- 

34 Gear Lubri 14 5606GE and API 61. 5; Bulk; Delivery in 200 gallon plus lots 10.61 10.61 per gallon PERF 500 EP BOW90 5% 0,53 11. 14

Petroleum Based; Multi Gear Meeting MILL2105C-EP, MIL- H- 

35GearLubrI14A 5606GE and API GLS; Delivery In 55 gallon drums 19.91090 per gallon IPERFSOO EP BOW90 Sul 0,55 11AS

Synthetic; Multi Gear Meeting MILL210SC- EP, MIL. H- 5606GE
db 6earLubn 1S and API( LS` bulk; Veliveryin2UUgallon pplus lots 19. 119. 1U per gallon PLRFSlid LSSYN IHEIICYSW90 ds-sds 5% 0.99 20.69

Synthetic; Mull( Gear Meeting MIL L2105C-EP, MIL- H- 5606GE

37 Gear Lubr1j15A afid API GLS; Dellyery in 55 gailgri firyms 19. 7 1 q 711 prr eplinn PFFIF 5001 S SYNTHFTIC 75Wgn t -qts 5% n qq 7n 6q

Re -Refined; Multi Gear Meeting MILL2105C-EP, MIL- H• 56066E

38 Gear Lubri 16 and API GLS; Bulk• Delivery In 200gallon plus lots No Old _ per. gallon no bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Re -Refined; Multi Gear Meeting MIL_L2105C-EP, MIL- H- 5606GE

39 Gear Lubrl 16A and API GLS; Delivery In 55 gallon drums No Bid pergallon no bid No Bid No Bid No gid

Conventional; Dexron- II or Type F or MP with GM " 0" Number

40 Autonlalie 17Aproval; Bulk; Delivery In 400 gallon plus lots 453 4.53 pergallon Performance SOOATF MD -3 ds 5% 0. 23 4. 76

Conventional; Dexron-II or -Type F or MP with GM "D" Number

41 Automatic 17A Approval; Delivered In 55 gallon drums 4, 53 4. 53 per gallon Performance 500 ATF MD -3 ds 5% 0123 4.76

Synthetic; Dexron• II or Type For MP with GM " D" Number

42 Automatic 18 Approval; Bulk; Delivered In 400 gallon plus lots 7. 69 7.69 pargallon PERF 500 FS HIVIS MV ATF - CA ds 5% 0.38 8. 07

Synthetic; Dexron- II or Type F or MP with GM " D" Number

43 Automatic IgA Approval; Delivered In 55 gallon drums 619.61 pargallon PERF SOO FS HIVIS MV ATF - CA pds 5% 0.48 10-09

Re -refined; Dexron- II or Type F or MP with GM "D" Number

44 Automatic 19 Approval, Bulk; Delivered In 400 gallon plus lots 5, 93 S. 93 per gallon PERF 500 REO ATF MD -3 5% 090 6. 23

Re -refined; Dexron-11 or Type F or MP with GM " 0" Number

45 Automatic 19A Approval; Bulk; Delivered In SS gallon drums 5. 93 5. 93 peroallon PERF $ 00 RED ATF MD -3 5% 0. 30 6, 23

Chassis Lubricant MP Lithium Base ( min) 3% Maly; Delivered In
46 Chassis Lu 20 120 lb drums 2. 43 243 per pound 5% On 255

Multipurpose Power Steering Fluid; for use In ALLGeneral Motors

GM), Ford, Chrysler, Honda, Nissan, and Toyota; 1 quart bottles

47 MultI, Purp 21 delivered by the case of at least 12 each 2. 92 2. 92 er uart 5% 0.15 3. 07

Tractor hydraulic fiuld/ oil; Must be certified for use In

transmissions, final drives and wet brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

John Deere and Elgin products; Bulk Delivery In 200 gallon plus

481 UniversalJ 22 lots 4. 26 4. 26 pergallon PERFORMANCE 500 PREMIUM THF pds.sds 5% 0. 21 4,47

Tractor hydraulic fluld/ oll; Must be certified for use In

transmissions, final drives and wet brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

49 Universal I 22A John Deere and Elginproducts; Delivered In 15 gallon containers 5. 66 5-66 per gallon PERFORMANCE 500 PREMIUM THF ds-sds 5% 0. 28 5, 94

Tractor hydraulic fluid/ oil; Must be certified for use In

transmissions, final drives and wet brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

50 Universal 1 220 John Deere and Elgin rgducts; Delivered In 55 gallon containers 4. 264.26 er allon PERFORMANCE 500 PREMIUM THF ds-sds 5% 0.21 4. 41

Re -refined tractor hydraulic fluid/ oil; Must be certified for use In

transmissions, final drives and writ brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

John Deere and Elgin products; Bulk Delivery In 200 gallon plus
51 Universal 11 23 lots 5. 95 5.95 pergallon PERF 500 REO PREMIUM UTF ds- sds S% 030 6. 25

Re -refined tractor hydraulic fluid/ oil; Must be certified for use In

transmissions, final drives and wet brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

52 Universal 23A John Deere and Elgin products; Delivered In 15 gallon containers 645 6.45 pergallon PERF 500 REO PREMIUM UTF pds. sds 5% 0,32 6.77

Re -refined tractor hydraulic fluid/ oll; Must be certified foruse In

transmissions, final drives and wet brakes In Case, Caterpillar, 

53 Universal I 236 lJohn Deere and Elgin products; Delivered In 55 gallon containers 5. 95 5, 95 per gallon PERF 500 REO PREMIUM UTF pds- sds 5% 0.30 6,25

Synthetic/ Ethylene/ Glycol Base with rust Inhibitors; Mixed

summer/ winter; shall be certified for use In ALL GM, Ford, 

Chrysler, Honda, Nlssa n, Toyota, International and Allison

products by the lubricant manufacture; Bulk Delivery In 400 gallon
S4IAnII.FnLet4 24 plus lots 5.05 5, 05pergalion 1KINI1Y DK606P-Y AMP HO 50150 pds- sds 5% 0151 5d0



Synthetic/ Ethylene/ Glycol Base with rust Inhibitors; Mixed

summer/ winter; shall be certified for use In ALL GM, Ford, 

Chrysler, Honda, Nissan, Toyota, International and Allison

products by the lubricant manufacture; Delivered In 55 gallon
55 Ant4fee! 24A drums 5. 55 5. 55 per gaflQn TRINITY DK60OP-YAMP HD So 50 pds. sds 5% 0. 2R SA3

Synthetic/ Ethylene/ Glycol Base with rust Inhibitors; Mixed

summer/ winter; shall be certifted for use In ALL GM, Ford, 

Chrysler, Honda, Nissan, Toyota, International and Allison

products by the lubricant manufacture; Delivered In case lots of 1
56 Anti- Free: 240 gallon containers 7,647.60 per gallon TRINITY DKSOOP- YAMP HD 5050 s- sds 5% 0381 8, 02

Recycled Anti-freeze; shall be certified for use In ALL GM, Ford, 

Chrysler, Honda, Nissan, Toyota, International and -Allison

products by the lubricant manufacturer; bulk Delivery In 400
57 Aiit6Fteet 25 gallon plus lots 5. 05 5.05 per gallon TRINITY DK60rIP-Y AMP HD 50/ 50 pds- sds 5% 0. 25 5. 30

Price Increase shall not not exceed percentage during The second
year. Vendor must enter percentage at the Unit Price ( 5% would

58 YearTwot YEAR2 be entered as .O5, 10% would be entered as 10, etc.) 0percentage

Percentage Increase during first extension period. Vendor must
enter percentage at the Unit Prlce( 5% would be entered as . 05, 

9 Contract FlrstRenewal 10% would be entered as. 10 etc,) 10 percentage

lecond Percentage increase durfngsewnd extension period. Vendor

must enter percentage at the Unit Price ( 5% would be entered as

60 Contract Renowal , 05, 101A would be entered as . 10, etc.) A5, ercentage


