AMENDMENT NO. FIVE TO CONTRACT NO. 35235 3 5 2 3 5

RE: Amendment No. Five of Contract No. 35235 (ITB LB19-008) for providing as-needed
blueprinting, reprographic, and related products and services to the City of Long Beach (Munis
Contract No. 31900316)

This Amendment to Contract No. 35235 is made and entered as of June 22, 2022 by and between the CITY
OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and Crisp Enterprises, Inc. (Contractor).

Contract No. 35235 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as indicated below by a check or
other mark preceding the appropriate amendment:

X 1. Second renewal extending the term to June 1, 2023.
X 2. Adding $400,0000; for new contract total of $1,990,000.
3. Prices during this period shall remain firm.

X 4. The price for certain items shall be increased as shown on Exhibit “A”, which is attached hereto and
incorporated herein by this reference.

5. The price for certain items shall be decreased as shown on Exhibit “A”, which is attached hereto and
incorporated herein by this reference.

6. The discount offered to the City is increased by %

7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit “B”", which is attached hereto and mcorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract

8. The locations identified on Exhibit “B”, which is attached hereto and mcorporated herein by this
reference, are hereby added to the Contract

9. Current permits, licenses, insurance and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1.

Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions in this Contract are ratified and confirmed and
remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated above.

Attach Notary if Qut-of-State Contractor

(Signature) (Signature)
Dageu Ml | QMA ‘N\\\\ev’
C Qé) (Print / Type Name) (\"FQ (Print / Type Name)
President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer ~President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one) (circle one)

THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

By: A/n/{“" J/L Jatrrn Approved as to form: -\3”\\( M/ Zoz2.1
City Manager ' CHARLES PARKIN, City Attorney
EXECUTED PuRsuant —

TO SECTION 301 By:
OF
THE CITY CHARTER,
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Attach Notary if Out-of-State Contractor

CONTRACTOR: CONTRA%OR:/) 7 ?Z
3S|g_,nature) (§|gnature)

O, N Brad Wller
QQQ (Print/ Type Name) C?Q (Print/ Type Name)

President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one) (circle one)

THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

/‘44'1 Ao J. Ditrerrs Approved as to form: JVH V9 2024

City Manager CHARLES PARKIN, City Attorney

] % ;:Q o
Deputy ./

EXECUTED p,
TO SEctio § RSUANT




Exhibit A

Price Increase



Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba

Crisp imaging
Costa Mesa, CA
Unit of
Item Num  |Section Item Code  |Description Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference |Average Percent Difference
A: DIAZO WHITEPRINTER, MEDIA Direct Blueline or Blackline Reproduction up to 54"
1}DEVELOPMENT item 01 Width PER SQ FT 1 $0.01 0.00% 7.93%
A: DIAZO WHITEPRINTER, MEDIA Non Erasable Sepia Vellum Reproduction up to 42"
2|DEVELOPMENT tem 02 Width PER SQ FT 1 $0.01 0.00%}CPI Los Angeles _
A: DIAZO WHITEPRINTER, MEDIA
3|DEVELOPMENT ftem 03 Erasable Sepia Vellum Reproduction up to 42" Width PER SQFT 1 $0.01 0.00%) 8.60%
A: DIAZO WHITEPRINTER, MEDIA Direct Presentation Brownline or Blackline Reproduction
4|DEVELOPMENT ftem 04 up to 42" Width PERSQFT 1 $0.04 0.00%
A: DIAZO WHITEPRINTER, MEDIA Direct Mylar or approved equal {plastic film}) Print
S|DEVELOPMENT Item 05 Reproduction up to 42" Width PERSQFT 1 50.92 8.24%|
B1:XEROGRAPHYGRAPHY: Large Format -
6|Same Size Development item 06 Bond PERSQ FT 1 $0.09 12.50%)|
B1:XEROGRAPHYGRAPHY: Large Format -
7|Same Size Devel ltem 07 Non-Erasable Vellum PERSQ FT 1 $0.43 7.50%|
B1:XEROGRAPHYGRAPHY: Large Format -
8|Same Size Devel ftem 08 Erasable Vellum PERSQFT 1 $0.43 7.50%|
B1:XEROGRAPHYGRAPHY: Large Format -
9|Same Size Development ftem 08 Presentation Bond #32 PER SQ.FT 1 $0.09 12.50%!
B1:XEROGRAPHYGRAPHY: Large Format -
10|Same Size Development Item 10 Mylar {or approved equal), 2-sided matte PER SQFT 1 $0.92 8.24%
B2: XEROGRAPHY: Large Format -
Reduction/Enlargement {Enlargements
up to 200%, down to 45%, up to 36%
11iwithout splice) Item 11 Bond PER SQ FT 1 $0.09 12.50%
B2: XEROGRAPHY: Large Format -
duction/Enlargement {Eni.
up to 200%, down to 45%, up to 36%
12jwithout splice) ftem 12 Non-Erasable Vellum PERSQFT 1 $0.43 7.50%]
B2: XEROGRAPHY: Large Format -
Reduction/Enlargement (Enlargements
up to 200%, down te 45%, up to 36%
13|without 5 ) ftem 13 Erasable Vellum PER SQLFT 1 $0.43 7.50%|
B2: XEROGRAPHY: Large Format -
juction/ {Enlar
up to 200%, down to 45%, up to 36%
14| without splice) ftem 14 Mylar {or approved equal}, 2-sided matte PER SQ FT 1 $0.92 8.24%
Color prints on paper to 11"x17" {can be printed in a
15|B3: XEROGRAPHY: Color Print ftem 15 small format printer) PER SQ FT 1 $0.22 10.00%|
Printing Specifications 8 1/2" x 11 double-sided
16{B3: XEROGRAPHY: Color Print Item 16 {minit of 300 sheets) with cover and screw posts. PERSQFT 1 $18.55 8.48%!
17{C: PLOTTING item 17 Bond {black and white printing ble} PERSQ FT 1 $0.09 12.50%
18{C: PLOTTING ftem 18 Vellum {black and white printing ble) PERSQ FT 1 $0.43 7.50%



Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba
Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA

JAverage Percent Difference

Unit of
Item Num  |Section item Code Description Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference

19]C: PLOTTING ftem 19 Mylar {black and white printing acceptable) PERSQ FT 1 $0.92 8.24%

20|C: PLOTTING tem 20 11" x 11" color plot of exhibits and Jaminati PERSQFT 1 $0.95 7.95%|
11" x 11" color plot of exhibits and lamination, double-

21|C: PLOTTING ftem 21 sided PERSQFT 1 $1.28 8.47%

22|C: PLOTTING tem 22 12" x 12" color plot of exhibits and lamination PERSQ.FT 1 $0.95 7.95%|
12" x 12" color plot of exhibits and lamination, double-

23|C: PLOTTING tem 23 sided PERSQFT 1 $1.28 8.47%

24{C: PLOTTING ltem 24 2' x 2' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board PER SQFT 1 $1.14 8.57%

251C: PLOTTING tem 25 3' x 3' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board PERSQLFT 1 $1.14 8.57%

26{C: PLOTTING Item 26 4' x 4' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board PER SQ FT 1 $1.14 8.57%!

27]C: PLOTTING ftem 27 5" % 5' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board PERSQFT 1 $1.14 8.57%
2' x 2' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board

28|C: PLOTTING Item 28 with dry erase PERSQFT 1 $1.86 B8.77%)]
3' x 3' color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board

29|C: PLOTTING ftem 29 with dry erase PERSQFT 1 $1.71 $1.86 8.77%)
4' x 4 color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board

30|C: PLOTTING ftem 30 with dry erase PER SQ FT 1 $1.86 8.77%
5' x 5’ color plot of exhibit, mounted on foam board

31|C: PLOTTING ftern 31 with dry erase PERSQFT 1 $1.86 8.77%)

32|C: PLOTTING ftem 32 x 2' color plot of exhibit, mounted on gator board PERSQFT 1 $1.84 8.24%




Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba
Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA

Unit of
Item Num  |Section item Code  {Description f Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference JAverage Percent Difference
33[C: PLOTTING item 33 3' x 3' color plot of exhibit, mounted on gator board PER SQ FT 1 $1:70 $1.84 8.24%
34]C; PLOTTING ftem 34 4' x 4' color plot of exhibit, mounted on gator board PER SQ FT 1 $1.70 $1.84 8.24%|
35{C: PLOTTING tem 35 5' x 5' color plot of exhibit, mounted on gator board PER SQ FT 1 $1.70 $1.84 8.24%)|
2' x 2' color plot of exhibit, mounted on sintra board
36|C: PLOTTING Item 36 with dry erase laminati PERSQFT 1 52.26 $2.45 8.41%
3' x 3' color plot of exhibit, mounted on sintra board
37]C: PLOTTING item 37 with dry erase laminati PER SQFT 1 $2.26 $245 8.41%)
4" x 4' color plot of exhibit, mounted on sintra board
38{C: PLOTTING Item 38 with dry erase laminati PER SQ FT 1 $2.26 $2.45 8.41%]
5'x 5' color plot of exhibit, mounted on sintra board
39{C: PLOTTING ftem 39 with dry erase lamination PERSQ.FT 1 $2.26 $2.45 8.41%]
40|C: PLOTTING Item 40 24" x 36" color plot {colored plans) PER SQ FT 1 $0.35 $0.38 8.57%!
41|C: PLOTTING tem 41 black and white plotting PERSQ FT 1 $0.08 $0.09 12.50%
LBPD Traffic Citations [Judicial Council of California Form
Revised 5/17 {Veh.Sec. 40500(b), 40513(b), 40522,
42[D: NCR PRINTING Item 44 40600; Pen. Code Sec. 853.9) TR-130] M=Per 1000 Per 20M 1 No Bid
431D: NCR PRINTING ltem 45 Animal Care Services Administrative Citations M=Per 1000 Per 20M 1 No Bid
See specifications|
on page 30 of 36
441E: VINYL BANNERS {ltem 46 72" x 38" after h in, single sided of T8 PER BANNER 1 $31.95 8.49%
See specifications
on page 31 of 36
45{E: VINYL BANNERS Item 47 72" x 38" after h in, double sided of ITB PER BANNER 1 $61.85 B8.51%




Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba

Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA
Unit of
Item Num  [Section Item Code Description fe Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference JAverage Percent Difference
on page 31 of 36
46|E: VINYL BANNERS Item 48 240" x 48" after h i of [TB PER BANNER 1 $134.54 8.50%|
See specifications
on page 31 of 36
471E: VINYL BANNERS item 49 480" x 96" after hermming of ITB PER BANNER 1 $329.84 8.50%
481E: VINYL BANNERS Item 50 Additional Square Footage for single sided vinyl banners PERSQFT 1 $1.90 8.57%!
Additional Square Footage for double sided viny!
49|E: VINYL BANNERS tem 51 banners PERSQFT 1 $3.26 8.67%]
See specifications|
WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP 8'-10° Length x 3'-5' Height (graphics above a wall or on page 32 of 36
50|{includ: liation) tem 52 concrete traffic barrier) of IT8 PER BANNER 1 $40.36 8.49%
See speci i
: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP 8'-10' Length x 5'-8' Height (installed on a standard chainon page 32 of 36
51|{includ: liation) tem 53 fink fence or metal fence) of ITB PER BANNER 1 $67.27 8.50%:
See specifications
F: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP on page 32 of 36
52|{includ llation) ftem 54 Banner of a smaller size, less than 100 ftA? of MB PER SQ FT 1 $1.90 8.57%
See specifications
F: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP on page 33 of 36
S3{{Includes liation) |item 5. Banner of a larger size, greater than 100 ftA2 of ITB PERSQ.FT 1 $1.68 8.39%
See specifications|
F: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP 3 mil 48" x 96" white aluminum composite with anti- on page 33 of 36
54{{includes llation) Item 56 {graffi inati of ITB PER BANNER 1 $119.68 $129.85 8.50%



Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba

Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA
Unit of
jtem Num _ {Section Item Code  {Description Reference Measure Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference |Average Percent Difference
See specifications
F: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP White premium high-tack adhesive vinyl in 10' sections |on page 33 of 36
55|(Includes Installation) item 57 with anti-graffiti laminati of ITB PER BANNER 1 $212.68 8.50%
See specificati
F: WINDSCREEN/GRAPHIC FENCE WRAP on page 34 of 36

56}{Includes Installation) ftem 58 4'x4' flutted chioroplast full color of ITB PER BANNER 1 $17.19 8.52%
3 mm white Sintra, full color print (outdoor
interpretative signs, trail maps, signs for inserts for

571G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING Item 59 existing sandwich board signs) PERSQFT 1 $1.87 8.72%
6 mm white Sintra, full color print {outdoor
interpretative signs, trail maps, signs for inserts for

581G: MISCELLANEOQUS PRINTING Item 60 existing sandwich board signs) PER SQ FT 1 $3.22 8.42%
Coroplast, full color print, full color print {light weight
water/irrigation signs with "H" frames/stakes, as were

59|G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING ftem 61 the signs placed in street fians) PER SQ FT 1 $1.33 8.13%|
3/16" Ultra-board, full color print, full color print

60|G: MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING ftem 62 {exterior signs requiring sturdy fal) PER SQ FT 1 $1.87 8.72%|
Utility Bill inserts {155M, trimmed size 8.5" x11", tri-fold;
full bleed, color 4/4, 80# book). Inserts shall be stored at
Bidder's facility until the City give notices to release
shipment(s}). Delivery shall be in cartons and will be
periodic; typically, 2-3 times during a 30 days billing

61|G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING tem 63 cycle. M=Per 1000 Per 155M 1 no bid No Bid
Police Fl cards {100M, trimmed size 3 %" x 5 ?", bleed,
color 1/1 black, 80# cover smooth uncoated long grain,
trim; round-corner 4" radius, must be printed offset-

621G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING Item 64 registration must be perfect) M=Per 1000 Per 100M 1 no bid No Bid
Public hearing posters {30" x 40", photo gloss paper, 5-

63|G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING tem 65 mm full-seal ination, no bleed, color 1/0 black} EACH 1 $28.44 $30.86 8.51%




Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba

Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA
Unit of
Item Num  |Section item Code Description e Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference JAverage Percent Difference
Purchase Order forms (100M 8.5” x11", no bleed, color
1/1 Pantone Process blue, 20# bond, shrink-wrap into
641G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING tem 66 packages of 100) M=Per 1000 Per 20M 1 no bid No Bid
Letterheads-must be printed offset-{0.5M, 8.5" x11", no
bleed, color 4/4, 24# Capito! Bond 96 bright white 24%
65G: MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING Item 67 rag) M=Per 1000 Per 0.5M 1 no bid No Bid
Presentation folders (gold foil finish, 9M, 80# Classic
Crest Patriot Blue, 10.5" x 26" bi-fold size, 10.5" x 13"
661G: MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING item 68 quarte-circle die cuts for inserting proclamation paper) |M=Per 1000 Per 1M 1 no bid No Bid
Certificate paper (10M, 4/0 + Gold Foil, 8.5" x 14" 80#
Sundance Felt Warm White Text, shrink-wrap into
67|G: MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING item 69 packages of 250) M=Per 1000 Per 5M 1 no bid No Bid
Decals - 4.5M, trimmed size 1" x 2" (color 4/0, UV-and
. 'weather-resistant, sequence numbered 0050001~
68|G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING item 70 009501) =Per 1000 Per 4.5M 1 no bid No Bid
Decals - 0.5M, trimmed size 2" x 2" (color 4/0, UV-and
weath i revers d,
69|G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING ftem 71 numbered 0000001-000500) M=Per 1000 Per 0.5M 1 no bid No Bid
Decals - 3M, trimmed size 5" x 3" (color 4/0, UV-and
- weather-res: T d,
70]G: MISCELLANEQUS PRINTING Item 72 numbered 0000001-003000) M=Per 1000 Per 3M 1 no bid No Bid
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
71iFINISHING ftem 73 Staple & Edge Bind Sets {up to 25 sheets} PER SET 1 $0.00 $0.00
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
72{FINISHING Item 74 Staple & Edge Bind Sets {up to 75 sheets} PER SET 1 $0.00 $0.00
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
73{FINISHING ftem 75 Staple only {up to 75 sheets) PER SET 1 30:35 $0.38 8.57%
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
74|FINISHING item 76 Full Bind Sets (up to 75 sheets) PER SET 1 $0.00 $0.00
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
75 |FINISHING ltem 77 Full Bind, Post Bound Sets {over 75 sheets) PER SET 1
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
76{FINISHING Item 78 Folding Prints & Copies (shop fold) PER SHEET 1 6.67%
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
77iFINISHING Item 79 Folding Prints & Copies (book fold/special fold) PER SHEET 1 0.00%




Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba
Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA

Number of Low Bid items

Number of 2nd Lowest Bid items

Number of No Bids 16
Payment Terms: NET30
Delivery {business days), excluding windscreen/graphic fence wrap: not specified
Delivery (b days) for windscreen/graphic fence wrap: not specified

Unit of
Item Num  |Section Item Code Description Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference Average Percent Difference
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
T8I FINISHING item 80 Folding Prints & Copies {map fold) PER SHEET 1 $0.16 6.67%
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
79|FINISHING Itern 81 Screw binding PER SET 1 $3.26 8.67%
H: MISCELLANEQUS BINDING AND
80|FINISHING Item 82 Scanning {color or black & white) PER SQ FT 1 $0.11 10.00%
H: MISCELLANEQUS BINDING AND
81|FINISHING {tem 83 Round-cornering (1/8" radius, all four corners} PER SHEET 1 $0.27 8.00%
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND Die-cutting/scoring {sample jobs Know More STD
82 |FINISHING ftem 84 packaging and LBPD patch holders) PER SHEET 1 $0.00
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
83 |FINISHING itemn 85 Serial numbering PER SHEET 1 $0.05 0.00%
H: MISCELLANEQUS BINDING AND
B4{FINISHING ftem 86 Lamination {10 mil lamil ) PER SQ FT 1 $1.30 833%
H: MISCELLANEOUS BINDING AND
85{FINISHING item 87 Shrink-wrapping PER PACKAGE 1 $0.27 8.00%
For blueprinting, preproduction and related services not
specified in bid, Contractor shall state percentage
discount to the City from Contractor's price list.
Contractor must enter percentage at the Unit Price (10%
86{1: MISCELLANEOUS OTHER {tem 88 would be entered as .10) PERCENTAGE 0 0%



Crisp Enterprises Inc., dba
Crisp Imaging
Costa Mesa, CA

Unit of

item Num  [Section ftem Code Description Reference Measure Quantity Unit Price New Price Percent Difference [Average Percent Difference

Sign Bid Cover Page YES

California All-Purpose Acknowled Notarized, if applicabl N/A

. Debarment Certification Form (Attachment A} YES
Reference List (Attachment B) YES

‘W-8 Form {Attachment C) YES

Equal Benefits Ordinance Form (Attachment D) YES

Secretary of State Certification {Attachment E) YES

First Source Hiring Program Ct i: h F) YES
Addendum No. 1Q & A YES

Addendum No. 2: Q & APart 2 YES

Addendum No. 3 YES

Notes




