

33956

AMENDMENT NO. ONE TO CONTRACT NO. 33956

RE: Renewal No. One of Contract No. 33956 (ITB LB15-007) for providing lamps and lighting fixtures to the City of Long Beach (BPLB16000002)

This Amendment to Contract No. 33956 is made and entered as of August 03, 2017, by and between the CITY OF LONG BEACH, a municipal corporation, and Spot Lighting Supplies Inc.

Contract No. 33956 is amended by mutual agreement of the parties and as indicated below by a check or other mark preceding the appropriate amendment:

- 1. First renewal option extending term to 09/30/18.
- 2. Adding \$50,000 for a new amount not to exceed \$200,000.
- 3. Prices during this period shall remain firm.
- 4. The price for certain items shall be increased as shown on Exhibit "A", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.
- 5. The price for certain items shall be decreased as shown on Exhibit "A", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference.
- 6. The discount offered to the City is increased by ____ %
- 7. The items or locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference, are hereby deleted from the Contract.
- 8. The items or locations identified on Exhibit "B", which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference, are hereby added to the Contract.
- 9. Current permits, licenses, insurance and other required information are attached as Addendum No. 1.

Except as expressly amended above, all terms and conditions in this Contract are ratified and confirmed and remain in full force and effect. Executed with all formalities required by law as of the date first stated above.

Attach Notary if Out-of-State Contractor

CONTRACTOR:

BJ Spotskey

(Signature)

ED SPOTSKEY

(Print / Type Name)

PRES

President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one)

CONTRACTOR:

BJ Spotskey

(Signature)

ED SPOTSKEY

(Print / Type Name)

VICE PRES

President / Vice President / Secretary / Treasurer
(circle one)

THE CITY OF LONG BEACH:

By: PL

City Manager

Approved as to form:

CHARLES PARKINI City Attorney

By: Charles Parkini

Deputy

EXHIBIT 'A' 8/9/17
 SPOT LOWER

West Life Cerritos Spot Lighting Long Beach Graybar Diamond Bar IEC Commerce

LED REPLACEMENTS ONLY

NAED/ Stock #	Unit Price	NAED/ Stock #	Unit Price	NAED/ Stock #	Unit Price	NAED/ Stock #	Unit Price
27 3891/PR2	\$ 0.22 PR2		\$0.24 No Bid				\$0.42
28 3890/PR3	\$ 0.22 PR3		\$0.24 No Bid				\$0.81
29 3891/PR4	\$ 0.22 PR4		\$0.24 No Bid				\$0.36
Compact Fluorescent Lamps:							
30 21134/SYL.CF13DS/841/ECCO	\$ 1.25 SYL# 21134		No Bid				\$1.59
31 21117/SYL.CF13DD/827/ECCO	\$ 1.70 SYL# 21117		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.16
32 21118/SYL.CF13DD/835/ECCO	\$ 1.70 SYL# 21118		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.47
33 20671/SYL.CF13DD/E/835/ECCO	\$ 1.88 SYL# 20671		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.44
34 21134/SYL.CF13DS/841/ECCO	\$ 1.25 SYL# 21134		\$1.25 No Bid				\$1.49
35 29567/SYL.CF13EL/MINI.841	\$ 2.05 SYL# 29567		\$2.20 No Bid				\$2.34
36 417378/PHILIPS.EL/A SWP 14W 6/1	\$ 2.90 GE# 89632		\$6.10 No Bid				\$7.28
37 21111/SYL.CF18DD/841/ECCO	\$ 1.79 SYL# 21111		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.36
38 20668/SYL.CF18DD/E/841/ECCO	\$ 1.88 SYL# 20668		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.36
39 21113/SYL.CF26DD/827/ECCO	\$ 1.75 SYL# 21113		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.96
40 21115/SYL.CF26DD/841/ECCO	\$ 1.75 SYL# 21115		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.96
41 20673/SYL.CF26DD/E/835/ECCO	\$ 1.88 SYL# 20673		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.59
42 20669/SYL.CF26DD/E/841/ECCO	\$ 1.88 SYL# 20669		\$1.75 No Bid				\$3.59
43 20454/SYL.CF26DT/827/ECCO	\$ 2.85 SYL# 20454		\$3.75 No Bid				\$5.29
44 20881/SYL.CF26DT/E/IN/835/ECCO	\$ 3.25 SYL# 20881		\$6.15 No Bid				\$4.87
45 156398/PHILIPS.EL/Mdt 32W LL 6/1	\$ 3.90 SYL# 29792		\$6.20 No Bid				\$7.52
46 20885/SYL.CF32DT/E/IN/835/ECCO	\$ 3.25 SYL# 20885		\$3.15 No Bid				\$4.92
47 20886/SYL.CF32DT/E/IN/841/ECCO	\$ 3.25 SYL# 20886		\$3.15 No Bid				\$4.92
48 20871/SYL.CF42DT/E/IN/835/ECCO	\$ 3.25 SYL# 20871		\$3.15 No Bid				\$5.70
49 21274/SYL.CF7DS/841/ECCO	\$ 1.25 SYL# 21274		\$1.25 No Bid				\$1.44
50 345132/PHILIPS.PL-L 36W/841/P	\$ 4.75 PHILIPS# 345132		\$4.75 No Bid				\$6.66
51 300434/PHILIPS.PL-L 40W/835/4P/RS/IS	\$ 3.95 PHILIPS# 300434		\$4.50 No Bid				\$5.98
52 300432/PHILIPS.PL-L 40W/841/4P/RS/IS	\$ 3.95 PHILIPS# 300442		\$4.50 No Bid				\$5.98
53 300432/PHILIPS.PL-L 40W/841/4P /RS/IS	\$ 3.95 PHILIPS# 300442		\$4.50 No Bid				\$5.98
54 1R2009/TCP.1R2009	\$ 4.50 TCP# 1R2009		\$5.75 TCP 1R2009				\$18.89
55 48913/TCP.48913	\$ 3.45 TCP# 48913		\$4.50 TCP 48913				\$9.96
56 48913/TCP.48913-Y	\$ 4.40 TCP# 48913-Y		\$5.80 TCP 48913-Y				\$10.00
57 801014/TCP.801014	\$ 1.35 TCP# 801014		\$1.60 TCP 801014				\$2.34
58 801019/TCP.801019	\$ 1.75 TCP# 801019		\$2.20 TCP 801019				\$2.44

X ED SPOTSKEY PRES.
 PRINT ED SPOTSKEY